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When Russia declared war on the Ottoman Empire in April 1877, it was the fifth time during the nineteenth
century that hostilities had broken out between the two empires. On this occasion the other Great Powers had
done all they could to prevent it, although public opinion in the West had been shocked by Turkey's brutal
repression of the Bulgarian uprising. The war was to be fought in two distinct theaters. In Europe, as on
previous occasions, the Russian objective was to cross first the Danube and then the formidable Balkan
Mountains before striking for Constantinople. In Asia, over territory also contested many times before, the
Russians aimed to seize Kars and then Erzerum.

At first all went well for the invaders, the Turks making no serious attempt to hold the line of the Danube,
while a thrust south by General Gourko succeeded in crossing the Balkans by a pass not previously
considered practicable. At Plevna, however, the Russian advance stalled in the face of the determined
defense of the place by the redoubtable Osman Pasha. In Asia, meanwhile, after initial success, the Russian
advance was halted by defeat at Zevin. Poor strategic judgment on the part of the Turks led to their failure to
take advantage of the opportunity provided by Osman, even after the Russians had suffered three bloody
defeats at Plevna. Eventually, after the town was closely invested, it fell to the besiegers.

In Asia, the Turks suffered a major defeat in the battle of God's Mountain, and were driven back to Erzerum,
while Kars fell to a brilliant assault by the Russian forces. These defeats marked the beginning of the end for
the Turks. By January 1878 the Russians were over the Balkans in force, and the last viable Turkish army
was surrounded and captured at Shenovo. Armistice negotiations led to a suspension of hostilities and to the
treaty of San Stefano. The other Great Powers had watched the conflict with mounting anxiety and were
determined to moderate the terms of San Stefano which had imposed harsh conditions on the Ottoman
Empire. This, following tortuous diplomatic negotiations, they succeeded in doing at the Congress of Berlin
in July 1878.

This book, the first military history of the war in English for over a century, traces the course of the
campaigns, examining the many occasions on which the outcome of a battle might have gone the other way,
and the performance of the combatants, both leaders and led. The book considers the extent to which the
parties applied the lessons of recent wars, as well as the conclusions that could be drawn from the experience
of combat with the latest weapons. It also explores the complicated motives of the Great Powers in general,
and Britain in particular, in bringing about a final settlement, which postponed the dissolution of the
Ottoman Empire.

The author's detailed text is accompanied by an extensive number of black and white illustrations, an
impressive color plate section containing reproductions of paintings by artists such as Vereshchagin, plus
black and white and color battle maps. Extensive orders of battle are also provided.

This is the latest title in Helion's ground-breaking series of 19th Century studies, and will again appear in
hardback as a strictly limited edition printing of 1,000 copies, each individually numbered and signed by the
author on a decorative title page.
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From reader reviews:

Joyce Adam:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet
and the resources within it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How many
people to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining
a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information particularly this War in the East: A Military History
of the Russo-Turkish War 1877-78 book because book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the
information in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Jason Dolly:

War in the East: A Military History of the Russo-Turkish War 1877-78 can be one of your starter books that
are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The
copy writer giving his/her effort to get every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing War in the East: A
Military History of the Russo-Turkish War 1877-78 but doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the
hottest in addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great
information can easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial pondering.

Lynn Groff:

You can get this War in the East: A Military History of the Russo-Turkish War 1877-78 by check out the
bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for
ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only simply by written or printed but also can you
enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking because of your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about
your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try
to choose right ways for you.

Joseph Franson:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but in addition novel and War in the East: A Military History of the
Russo-Turkish War 1877-78 or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know
how the good a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher as
well as students especially. Those books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In some other case,
beside science guide, any other book likes War in the East: A Military History of the Russo-Turkish War
1877-78 to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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