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Twenty years after its release, Phish's double-CD collection A Live One has something rare and precious
going for it: it still doesn't sound like anybody else. Oversized, perverse, requiring an unusual amount of
listener background knowledge? Yes to all. Yet the collective improvisations it captures, unprecedentedly
coherent yet freewheeling and open-ended, are unique in rock 'n' roll.

This book considers the music and moment of Phish's ecstatically inventive 1995 live document, a mix of
weirdo acid-psych, ambient moonscapes, vaudevillian Americana, and riotous arena-rock energy, all filtered
through bandleader Trey Anastasio's screwball compositional sensibility and the band's idiosyncratic
approach to spontaneous group creativity. It places Phish and their fandom in historical and cultural context,
and picks apart the mechanics of their extended group jams. And it examines the mystery of how a quartet of
nice boys from Burlington, VT could have been, all at once, one of America's biggest touring acts and one of
its best-kept secrets.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Lowe:

The book Phish's A Live One (33 1/3) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book Phish's A Live One (33 1/3)? Some
of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this book can give many facts for us. It is
absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that,
you could give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Phish's A Live One (33 1/3) has simple
shape but the truth is know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by
start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Timothy McCormack:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get
great deal of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of
activity do you have when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer can unlimited right.
Then do you ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time,
the particular book you have read is definitely Phish's A Live One (33 1/3).

Tony Valdez:

Beside that Phish's A Live One (33 1/3) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to the
new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so
don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Phish's A
Live One (33 1/3) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you at times have book but you
would not get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this within your hand. The
Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it?
Find this book along with read it from at this point!

Scott Schiller:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library
or to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or
real their leisure activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this
time there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring as well as
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Phish's A Live One (33 1/3) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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