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While You Owe Yourself a Drunk was far from the first anthropological study of a non-native population in
North America, its appearance marked an early stage in an increasingly evident shift toward “bringing
anthropology home.” Now available from Waveland Press, Spradley’s carefully researched portrayal of skid
row men in Seattle in the late sixties documents their treatment by jails and the legal system in a time before
homelessness became a recognized problem. As a result of Spradley’s elegant and impassioned writing, the
book became a sharp challenge to politicians, policymakers, judges, police, and others inclined to punish
people “for the crime of poverty.” The insights he gained from studying the tramp culture of Seattle
ultimately were seen as highly significant in the treatment of recidivist alcoholics as well as in creating a
more appropriate and human response to public drunkenness. This now-classic landmark study in urban
ethnography stands as a shining example of the direct application of distinctly anthropological concepts and
methods to address real-world problems. But more important, it represents a poignant challenge to society
about our capacity to endure and accept nonconformity and social diversity. The Waveland reissue includes a
valuable retrospective introduction by Merrill Singer.
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From reader reviews:

Tod Espitia:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This You Owe Yourself a Drunk: An
Ethnography of Urban Nomads is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Janice Saucier:

You can obtain this You Owe Yourself a Drunk: An Ethnography of Urban Nomads by check out the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for
your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but in addition can you
enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking by your mobile phone
and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your
e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to
choose appropriate ways for you.

Janet Warren:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you
know that little person like reading or as examining become their hobby. You must know that reading is very
important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except your
teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something by book. Numerous books that
can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually You Owe Yourself a Drunk: An Ethnography
of Urban Nomads.

Carl Terrell:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt it when they get
a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book You Owe Yourself a Drunk: An Ethnography of
Urban Nomads to make your own reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is
developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it
and mingle the sensation about book and looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to
wide open a book and go through it. Beside that the e-book You Owe Yourself a Drunk: An Ethnography of
Urban Nomads can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse with the information must
you're doing of their time.
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