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During the eighteenth and early years of the nineteenth century, the red tide of British expansion had covered
almost the entire Indian subcontinent, stretching to the borders of the Punjab. There the great Sikh ruler
Ranjit Singh had developed his military forces to thwart any British advance into his kingdom north of the
River Sutlej.

Yet on the death of Ranjit Singh, unworthy successors and disparate forces fought over his legacy while the
British East India Company seized on the opportunity and prepared for battle. In the winter of 1845, the First
Anglo-Sikh War broke out. From the start, the two-month campaign was marred by Victorian arrogance and
bluster on the British side and personal ambition, intrigue and treason in the Sikh camp. Five keenly fought
contests ensued, including the great battle of Ferozeshah where the British force found itself caught between
two powerful Sikh armies and came close to destruction. Declining to retreat, Sir Hugh Gough, the British
Commander-in-Chief, told his second in command: ‘My mind is made up. If we must perish, it is better that
our bones should bleach honorably at Ferozeshah than rot at Ferozepore: but they shall do neither the one nor
the other.’ The fate of the British Empire in India would be decided that day.

Amarpal Singh writes a warts-and-all tale of a conflict characterized by treachery, tragedy and incredible
bravery on both sides. In an innovative approach to history writing, the narrative of the campaign is
accompanied by battlefield guides that draw on eyewitness accounts and invite the reader to take a tour of
the battlefields, either physically or virtually. Fully illustrated with period drawings, modern-day
photographs and new maps, The First Anglo-Sikh War gives a forgotten conflict the meticulous attention it
deserves.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Barrett:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new info.
When you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of a number of ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this The First
Anglo-Sikh War, you could tells your family, friends and also soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge
can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Alberta Jones:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book
entitled The First Anglo-Sikh War your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each
aspect that maybe unknown for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
guide then become one web form conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get before. The The
First Anglo-Sikh War giving you one more experience more than blown away your mind but also giving you
useful information for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point
is your body and mind will likely be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you
want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Daryl Church:

Beside that The First Anglo-Sikh War in your phone, it could give you a way to get closer to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from oven so don't be
worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have The First Anglo-Sikh
War because this book offers for your requirements readable information. Do you occasionally have book
but you would not get what it's all about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this inside your hand. The
Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still
want to miss that? Find this book along with read it from today!

Sandra Birk:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book The First Anglo-Sikh War was vibrant and of course has
pictures on the website. As we know that book The First Anglo-Sikh War has many kinds or genre. Start
from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and believe
that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it can make
you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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