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The arduous 200 light year space journey from a destroyed Earth is finally over. Now Captain Nick Johns
and the crew of the spaceship Genesis must carve out space on a new world to colonize. Unfortunately, their
new home planet, Genesis Prime, is already inhabited by three sentient races, one of which is human
transplanted from Earth in the 3rd Century BC by aliens needing slave labor.

Captain Johns and his crew liberate the enslaved humans and capture the aliens ruling over them. The human
slaves still lived in the 3rd Century culture and viewed the humans of the Genesis as Olympian gods, actually
believing Captain Johns was the Olympian god, Zeus.

During the liberation they also captured the alien technology, which was far more advanced than that of the
Genesis. Eventually they befriend the few remaining aliens and learn the secrets of their technology, one of
which is a Plasma Bubble that can transport matter through time and space. They use this technology to free
the last remaining almost extinct aliens from their home world. In doing so, the Genesis attracts the attention
of the alien's adversaries that were waging genocide against them. These adversaries now turn their war upon
the Genesis colony.

Battles rage against these vicious, attacking aliens until the Genesis must face the most ruthless and
dangerous race yet, the Human Race. Captain johns learns with absolute certainty that humans can not be
trusted to govern themselves. Humans by their very nature are self-destructive, and given enough time they
will destroy themselves. The hardest battles came from within the Human Race and its inherent treachery.
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From reader reviews:

Bryant Kelly:

Do you one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Genesis Prime book is readable by means of you who hate those perfect word style.
You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving actually
decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer involving Genesis Prime content conveys the
idea easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but
it just different by means of it. So , do you still thinking Genesis Prime is not loveable to be your top listing
reading book?

Megan Urick:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book in which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly feel happy read one
along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Typically the Genesis Prime is kind of guide
which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Richard McCormick:

Often the book Genesis Prime has a lot details on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a
lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous author. The writer makes some research before
write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can find the point easily after reading this book.

Russell Thomas:

You will get this Genesis Prime by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could possibly
to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not
only by means of written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern
era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your personal ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange yourself
to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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