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Forget the myth of the sweet Irish Colleen. Real Irish women were no cream-puff debs. From the ancient
warrior queens Marrigan, Macha, and Badbh to the labor-movement maven Mother Jones, Irish women have
backbones of steel. Wild Irish Roses is a fascinating look at wild Irish women throughout history; serious
information imparted in Trina Robbins' trademark style, with verve and humor.

The women in Wild Irish Roses are not always nice girls or even good girls, but they are women who know
how to get things done, whether on the battlefield or in the bedroom. These are women who preserved and
handed down the old stories. They are women who fought in revolutions with either gun or pen, wrote books,
starred in books others wrote, and stormed heaven itself.

Author Trina Robbins is an impeccable researcher whose knack for telling stories and embellishing them
with engaging illustrations and photos, brings each of these Wild Irish Roses to life, including:
Maeve and six other warrior queensGrania and Deirdre, who ran away from kings for the love of younger
menFive women who turned themselves into birds to get the job done rightSaint Brigit and the saintly
Kathleen O'SheaCultural revivalist Maude Gonne and friendsIrish-American beauty roses, including Scarlett
O'HaraAnd warriors in their own right, such as Mother Jones and company

Wild Irish Roses is a celebration of tough, independent, beautiful Irish women from myth to modernity. It's a
book that is sure to entertain, inform, and inspire readers of every background to find the Irish rose in
themselves--to discover what they want and have the courage to go out and get it.
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From reader reviews:

William Chapman:

The book Wild Irish Roses: Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior Queens can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the best thing like a
book Wild Irish Roses: Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior Queens? Some of you have a different
opinion about reserve. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate.
Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for
each other; you could share all of these. Book Wild Irish Roses: Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior
Queens has simple shape however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appearance the
enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

James Pickett:

The reserve with title Wild Irish Roses: Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior Queens includes a lot of
information that you can study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. That book exist new
know-how the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world today. That is
important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you within new
era of the globalization. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere
you want.

Colin Wegner:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well as to make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's internal or real their
interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing reading
very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along with can't see colorful pics on
there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this era, many ways
to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Wild Irish Roses:
Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior Queens can make you really feel more interested to read.

David Saenz:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With
the book Wild Irish Roses: Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior Queens we can get more advantage.
Don't someone to be creative people? To become creative person must prefer to read a book. Just simply
choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life by this book Wild Irish
Roses: Tales of Brigits, Kathleens, and Warrior Queens. You can more appealing than now.
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