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Whaling has become one of the most controversial environmental issues. It is not that all whale species are at
the brink of extinction, but that whales have become important symbols to both pro- and anti-whaling
factions and can easily be appropriated as the common heritage of humankind. This book, the first of its
kind, is therefore not about whales and whaling per se but about how people communicate about whales and
whaling. It contributes to a better understanding and discussion of controversial environmental issues: Why
and how are issues selected? How is knowledge on these issues produced and distributed by organizations
and activists? And why do affluent countries like Japan and Norway still support whaling, which is of
insignificant economic importance? Basing his analysis on fieldwork in Japan and Norway and at the
International Whaling Commission, the author argues how an image of a "superwhale" has been constructed
and how this image has replaced meat and oil as the important whale commodity. He concludes that the
whaling issue provides an arena where NGOs and authorities on each side can unite, swapping political
legitimacy and building personal relations that can be useful on issues where relations are less harmonious.
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From reader reviews:

Stephan Partin:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, individual feel need book if they found difficult problem or maybe
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Unveiling the Whale: Discourses on Whales and Whaling
(Environmental Anthropology and Ethnobiology).

Anthony Jarrard:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great and important the book Unveiling the Whale: Discourses
on Whales and Whaling (Environmental Anthropology and Ethnobiology). All type of book are you able to
see on many options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Tamara Evans:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Unveiling the Whale: Discourses on Whales
and Whaling (Environmental Anthropology and Ethnobiology) is our recommendation so you keep up with
the world. Why, because book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Gregory Eubanks:

The knowledge that you get from Unveiling the Whale: Discourses on Whales and Whaling (Environmental
Anthropology and Ethnobiology) is the more deep you digging the information that hide within the words
the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be aware of but
Unveiling the Whale: Discourses on Whales and Whaling (Environmental Anthropology and Ethnobiology)
giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in certain way that can be
understood simply by anyone who read it because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This
specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can
go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this particular Unveiling
the Whale: Discourses on Whales and Whaling (Environmental Anthropology and Ethnobiology) instantly.
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