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Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya offers an A-to-Z overview of the ancient Maya culture from its inception
around 3000 BC to the Spanish Conquest after AD 1600. Over two hundred entries written by more than
sixty researchers explore subjects ranging from food, clothing, and shelter to the sophisticated calendar and
now-deciphered Maya writing system. They bring special attention to environmental concerns and climate
variation; fresh understandings of shifting power dynamics and dynasties; and the revelations from emerging
field techniques (such as LiDAR remote sensing) and newly explored sites (such as La Corona, Tamchen,
and Yaxnohkah).

This one-volume reference is an essential companion for students studying ancient civilizations, as well as a
perfect resource for those planning to visit the Maya area. Cross-referencing, topical and alphabetical lists of
entries, and a comprehensive index help readers find relevant details. Suggestions for further reading
conclude each entry, while sidebars profile historical figures who have shaped Maya research. Maps
highlight terrain, archaeological sites, language distribution, and more; over fifty photographs complement
the volume.
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From reader reviews:

Geraldine Davis:

The event that you get from Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya will be the more deep you digging the
information that hide within the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to comprehend but Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya giving you joy feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood through anyone who read the idea
because the author of this guide is well-known enough. That book also makes your current vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
recommend you for having this specific Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya instantly.

Theodore Pritchard:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Encyclopedia of the
Ancient Maya that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading
practice all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far better then how they react
to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky person but for all of you
who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your good habit,
you may pick Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya become your starter.

Judith Judd:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended for
you is Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya this e-book consist a lot of the information from the condition of
this world now. This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The language styles
that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some study when he makes
this book. That's why this book acceptable all of you.

Bernadine Parker:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may have it
in e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya can give you a lot of
good friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make a person
more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than
additional make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let's have Encyclopedia of the Ancient Maya.
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