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At the beginning of World War II, the United States and Mexico launched the bracero program, a series of
labor agreements that brought Mexican men to work temporarily in U.S. agricultural fields. In Braceros,
historian Deborah Cohen asks why these temporary migrants provoked so much concern and anxiety in the
United States and what the Mexican government expected to gain in participating in the program. Cohen
reveals the fashioning of a U.S.-Mexican transnational world, a world created through the interactions,
negotiations, and struggles of the program's principal protagonists including Mexican and U.S. state actors,
labor activists, growers, and bracero migrants. Cohen argues that braceros became racialized foreigners,
Mexican citizens, workers, and transnational subjects as they moved between U.S. and Mexican national
spaces.

Drawing on oral histories, ethnographic fieldwork, and documentary evidence, Cohen creatively links the
often unconnected themes of exploitation, development, the rise of consumer cultures, and gendered class
and race formation to show why those with connections beyond the nation have historically provoked
suspicion, anxiety, and retaliatory political policies.
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From reader reviews:

Brenda Schweiger:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or goal; it means that book has different type.
Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be reading whatever they
consider because their hobby is reading a book. What about the person who don't like examining a book?
Sometime, man or woman feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well, probably
you will want this Braceros: Migrant Citizens and Transnational Subjects in the Postwar United States and
Mexico.

Danielle Deguzman:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name Braceros: Migrant
Citizens and Transnational Subjects in the Postwar United States and Mexico suitable to you? The book was
written by well known writer in this era. The book untitled Braceros: Migrant Citizens and Transnational
Subjects in the Postwar United States and Mexicois a single of several books which everyone read now. This
kind of book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new
dimensions that you ever know just before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, therefore
all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a lots of information
about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world in this book.

Richelle Johnson:

The book untitled Braceros: Migrant Citizens and Transnational Subjects in the Postwar United States and
Mexico is the book that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the book content that will be
shown to you actually. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the book, and so the information that they
share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Braceros: Migrant Citizens
and Transnational Subjects in the Postwar United States and Mexico from the publisher to make you a lot
more enjoy free time.

Robert Mayo:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting Braceros: Migrant Citizens
and Transnational Subjects in the Postwar United States and Mexico that give your satisfaction preference
will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the
opportinity for people to know world considerably better then how they react toward the world. It can't be
mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants
to be success person. So , for all you who want to start studying as your good habit, you could pick Braceros:



Migrant Citizens and Transnational Subjects in the Postwar United States and Mexico become your current
starter.
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