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Restores to the forefront of the Christian tradition the importance of the divine feminine

• The first complete English-language translation of the original Coptic Gospel of Mary, with line-by-line
commentary

• Reveals the eminence of the divine feminine in Christian thought

• Offers a new perspective on the life of one of the most controversial figures in the Western spiritual
tradition

Perhaps no figure in biblical scholarship has been the subject of more controversy and debate than Mary
Magdalene. Also known as Miriam of Magdala, Mary Magdalene was considered by the apostle John to be
the founder of Christianity because she was the first witness to the Resurrection. In most theological studies
she has been depicted as a reformed prostitute, the redeemed sinner who exemplifies Christ's mercy. Today's
reader can ponder her role in the gospels of Philip, Thomas, Peter, and Bartholomew--the collection of what
have come to be known as the Gnostic gospels rejected by the early Christian church. Mary's own gospel is
among these, but until now it has remained unknown to the public at large.

Orthodox theologian Jean-Yves Leloup's translation of the Gospel of Mary from the Coptic and his thorough
and profound commentary on this text are presented here for the first time in English. The gospel text and the
spiritual exegesis of Leloup together reveal unique teachings that emphasize the eminence of the divine
feminine and an abiding love of nature over the dualistic and ascetic interpretations of Christianity presented
elsewhere. What emerges from this important source text and commentary is a renewal of the sacred
feminine in the Western spiritual tradition and a new vision for Christian thought and faith throughout the
world.
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From reader reviews:

Jodie Long:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or goal; it means that book has different
type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They may be reading whatever
they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't like studying a
book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well, probably
you will want this The Gospel of Mary Magdalene.

Logan Merritt:

The knowledge that you get from The Gospel of Mary Magdalene will be the more deep you looking the
information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is
hard to recognise but The Gospel of Mary Magdalene giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The writer
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by means of anyone who read the item because the
author of this e-book is well-known enough. That book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase
well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available.
We advise you for having this particular The Gospel of Mary Magdalene instantly.

William Butcher:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or perhaps
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a
book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day every day to
reading a guide. The book The Gospel of Mary Magdalene it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
individuals who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. If you did not have
enough space to create this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book
from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book possesses high quality.

Laura Lee:

E-book is one of source of information. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen want book to know the upgrade information of year to help year. As we know those
publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. Through the book The Gospel of Mary Magdalene we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to
definitely be creative people? Being creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply choose the best book
that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with this book The Gospel of
Mary Magdalene. You can more desirable than now.
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