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Pode-se comparar o euro a um veículo com 23 secções articuladas, nas quais todas as rodas são de dimensões
diferentes. Não irá muito longe.
Rudo de Ruijter

A classe dominante portuguesa não prima pela lucidez, não tem um projecto de desenvolvimento e age -
reage - aos seus medos. Decidiu entrar para a UE como uma espécie de "seguro" contra veleidades
revolucionárias - assustou-se com a Revolução de Abril e com os avanços progressistas que se deram a
seguir.

Este livro é uma tentativa de relançar as discussões que realmente importam.

Os autores aqui reunidos não são os economistas vulgares, os mistificadores formatados na ideologia
neoliberal, que imperam actualmente nos media portugueses.

Os autores apresentam diagnósticos reais acerca da presente situação na Europa e, para além disso, propõem
terapias para evitar o destino sinistro que neste momento está a ser forjado pelo BCE, UE e FMI: a ditadura
do capital financeiro.

Esta obra encontra-se também disponível como ebook. Siga o link:
Ascensão e Queda do Euro

Partilhe este livro:facebooktwittergoogle+
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Ables:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other
is high. For you who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Ascensão e Queda do Euro
(Portuguese Edition) book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Edward Knudsen:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Ascensão e Queda do Euro
(Portuguese Edition) book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that can
be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every
ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still doubt Ascensão e Queda do Euro
(Portuguese Edition) as good book but not only by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve
that can break don't determine book by its deal with, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this
kind of!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.

Todd Voss:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Ascensão e Queda do Euro (Portuguese Edition) can
be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Jennifer Williams:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but also novel and Ascensão e Queda do Euro (Portuguese Edition) or
maybe others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel
need to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or even students especially. Those
guides are helping them to bring their knowledge. In some other case, beside science guide, any other book
likes Ascensão e Queda do Euro (Portuguese Edition) to make your spare time much more colorful. Many
types of book like this.
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