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The largest company in the world by far, Wal-Mart takes in revenues in excess of $280 billion, employs 1.4
million American workers, and controls a large share of the business done by almost every U.S. consumer-
product company. More than 138 million shoppers visit one of its 5,300 stores each week. But, as recent
news stories show, Wal-Mart's "everyday low prices" come at a tremendous cost to workers, suppliers,
competitors, and consumers.

The definitive portrait of the juggernaut that is reshaping American, The Bully of Bentonville exposes the
zealous, secretive, small-town mentality that rules Wal-Mart and chronicles its far-reaching consequences. In
a gripping, richly textured narrative, Anthony Bianco shows how Wal-Mart has driven down retail wages
throughout the country, even as their substandard pay and meager health-care policy have led to a double-
digit employee turnover; why their aggressive expansion inevitably puts locally owned stores out of
business; and how their pricing policies have forced suppliers to outsource work and move thousands of jobs
overseas. Their power even influences what Americans can read, watch, and listen to; in the name of
protecting its customers, Wal-Mart bans "racy" magazines and insists on sanitized versions of popular DVDs
and CDs.

Based on countless interviews with Wal-Mart employees, managers, executives, competitors, suppliers,
customers, and community leaders, The Bully of Bentonville illuminates the story-behind-the-headlines and
brings the truths about Wal-Mart into sharp focus.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Stanley Wells:

The book The Bully of Bentonville can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the great thing like a book The Bully of Bentonville?
Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many information for
us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or information that
you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book The Bully of
Bentonville has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appear the
enormous world by open up and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Laura Hargis:

This book untitled The Bully of Bentonville to be one of several books which best seller in this year, that's
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book shop or you can order it by using online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It
makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this book from your list.

Claudia Kelley:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will probably unlimited
right. Then do you ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time,
the particular book you have read is usually The Bully of Bentonville.

Albert Hartley:

The book untitled The Bully of Bentonville contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your
ex idea with easy approach. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not worry, you can
easy to read that. The book was written by famous author. The author provides you in the new time of
literary works. You can read this book because you can read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read
the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide
open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice examine.
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