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To find his missing father, a young boy must cross over to another dimension

It’s been six months since David Moore’s father disappeared. After months of strange behavior—baby talk,
forgetfulness—he simply vanished forever. The Public Guardians searched Franklin City, but they couldn’t
turn up a single clue. David is beginning to give up hope when his subrail train stops between stations at the
abandoned Granite Street platform. On the other side of the glass he sees a crowd of people. In the middle is
his father, waving.
 
When a psychic suggests that David may have the power to see into another dimension, he and his friends
scour the city in search of a portal to the other side. To learn if his father is alive or dead, David will need to
discover the secrets of the abandoned station.
 
Last Stop was selected by the American Library Association as a 1999 Best Book for Reluctant Young Adult
Readers.
 
This ebook features an illustrated biography of Peter Lerangis including rare photos and never-before-seen
documents from the author’s personal collection.
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Browning:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the headline Last Stop
(Watchers Book 1) suitable to you? Often the book was written by popular writer in this era. The book
untitled Last Stop (Watchers Book 1)is the one of several books that everyone read now. That book was
inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new dimension that you
ever know prior to. The author explained their plan in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to
know the core of this book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you
to see the represented of the world in this book.

Livia Wilder:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Last Stop (Watchers Book 1)
publication written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that may be understand by
anyone who have read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and
writing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism Last Stop (Watchers Book 1) as
good book not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't
judge book by its deal with, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on
your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Gwendolyn Harrison:

This Last Stop (Watchers Book 1) is fresh way for you who has fascination to look for some information
given it relief your hunger of information. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or
perhaps you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Last Stop (Watchers Book 1) can be the
light food for yourself because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by anyone. These
books develop itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book form. People who
think that in reserve form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So there is not any in
reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't
miss that! Just read this e-book variety for your better life as well as knowledge.

Suzanne Mitchell:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year seemed
to be exactly added. This e-book Last Stop (Watchers Book 1) was filled in relation to science. Spend your
extra time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has various feel when they
reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the
modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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