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Bored and frustrated with the restricted life of a Victorian young lady, Laetitia encounters the romance she
so longs for when she becomes lost during a clandestine night-time ride and is rescued by Gronwy.
Attempting to assist Gronwy's ambitions by lending him books from her father's library, Laetitia becomes
increasingly aware of her own disempowerment and the passionate desires which drive her into a love affair
with him. Their secret meetings are paralleled with the tender relationship developing between Gronwy's
brother Peter, and another local farmer's daughter, Elizabeth Evans. After Gronwy is imprisoned for inciting
a riot at the local by-election, the novel moves inexorably towards its tragic ending at the local 'Wishing
Chair', a throne-like slab of rock above the river where the lovers meet. Opening in the spring of 1866, Here
are Lovers is set in 'Llangantyn', Radnorshire and was originally published in 1926, the year of the General
Strike - it is one of the few novels to centre on an election.
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From reader reviews:

Paul Kline:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is high.
For you who want to start reading the book, we give you this kind of Here Are Lovers (Welsh Women's
Classics) book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Elmer Pereira:

The particular book Here Are Lovers (Welsh Women's Classics) will bring that you the new experience of
reading some sort of book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new
book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Here Are Lovers (Welsh Women's Classics) is
much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Maria Clyburn:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get lot
of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have you got when the
spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the particular book you have read
is actually Here Are Lovers (Welsh Women's Classics).

Judi Orta:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this reserve. This Here Are Lovers (Welsh Women's
Classics) is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did
not include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you simpler
to read it. You can save often the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when one buys this book.
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