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In Detail

SQL Server 2012 includes BI-specific features such as cube analytics, reporting-related features,
multidimensional BI semantic models, and many more. This is a new addition that is of great use to Business
Analysts, who can now build BI semantic models using the relational tables from the database engine rather
than the dimensions from analysis services.

Instant Microsoft SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security is a practical, hands-on guide that
provides clear, step-by-step recipes for getting started with cube security. As a Database Administrator and
Data Architect, data security is of prime concern, and this book highlights the key concepts of securing
cubes. By the end of this book, you will understand the SQL Server security model and how to effectively
implement the same on the data platform.

Security is paramount within a data platform, and thankfully, the issues surrounding data access can be fixed
in the initial stages of its design. This allows you to avoid any breach of data access layers. The recipes in
this book consist of the required ingredients to implement and administer OLAP & BI security management
for your cubes. With this book, you will master the key aspects of implementing and managing security
essentials and securing data layers.

The recipes in this book incorporate best practice implementation, which include step-by-step instructions
for creating models that implement security based on the currently logged on Windows user name or based
on custom data passed to analysis services. The new BI platform features will help end users, business users,
and technology users by providing a robust environment for IT, planning, budgeting, forecasting with
scorecards, and reporting capabilities for the business users. These analytics will help end users to create a
comprehensive management application to view the data with ease.

Approach

Filled with practical, step-by-step instructions and clear explanations for the most important and useful tasks.
Instant Microsoft SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security is a practical, hands-on guide that
provides a number of clear, step-by-step exercises for getting started with cube security.

Who this book is for

This book is aimed at Database Administrators, Data Architects, and Systems Administrators who are
managing the SQL Server data platform. It is also beneficial for analysis services developers who already
have some experience with the technology, but who want to go into more detail on advanced topics and learn
best practices for cube design.
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From reader reviews:

James Rose:

This book untitled Instant SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security to be one of several books that
will best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit
on it. You will easily to buy that book in the book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher of
the book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in your
Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Irene Weinstein:

The book Instant SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security has a lot of knowledge on it. So when
you read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes
some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point
easily after scanning this book.

Whitney Martinez:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book especially book
entitled Instant SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security the mind will drift away trough every
dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe not known for but surely will become your mind friends.
Imaging every word written in a guide then become one contact form conclusion and explanation in which
maybe you never get before. The Instant SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security giving you yet
another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful information for your better
life in this era. So now let us show you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind will probably
be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Yvonne Matz:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known
as of book Instant SQL Server Analysis Services 2012 Cube Security. Contain your knowledge by it.
Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
significant that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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