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Whose poster hung on your wall as a teenager? Whose record did you wear out? Whose life story could you
not resist? Fascination works in mysterious ways—it can be born out of inspiration, or repulsion, or both. In
these daring essays, some of the most provocative writers of our time offer a private view on a public figure.
In the process, they reveal themselves in beautiful and unexpected ways, blurring the line between biography
and memoir.

Original essays:

Introduction by Amy Scholder●

Mary Gaitskill on Linda Lovelace●

Rick Moody on Karen Dalton●

Johanna Fateman on Andrea Dworkin●

Danielle Henderson on bell hooks●

Hanne Blank on MFK Fisher●

Kate Zambreno on Kathy Acker●

Justin Vivian Bond on Karen Graham●

Jill Nelson on Aretha Franklin●

Zoe Pilger on Mary Gaitskill●
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From reader reviews:

James Baker:

The book Icon make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable far more
increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using your
subject. If you can make looking at a book Icon being your habit, you can get much more advantages, like
add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You may know everything if
you like available and read a reserve Icon. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or
encyclopedia or some others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Christina Webb:

Now a day people who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How people
have to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Icon book because this book offers you
rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no
doubt in it you probably know this.

Alicia Romero:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book especially book entitled Icon
your mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe mysterious for but
surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become one web form
conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get ahead of. The Icon giving you yet another
experience more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful information for your better life
within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind will likely be pleased
when you are finished reading it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare
time activity?

Jose Chapman:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just in
search of the Icon when you necessary it?
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