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This work proposes strategies and solutions to tackle the problem of building photo-mosaics of very large
underwater optical surveys, presenting contributions to the image preprocessing, enhancing and blending
steps, and resulting in an improved visual quality of the final photo-mosaic. The text opens with a
comprehensive review of mosaicing and blending techniques, before proposing an approach for large scale
underwater image mosaicing and blending. In the image preprocessing step, a depth dependent illumination
compensation function is used to solve the non-uniform illumination appearance due to light attenuation. For
image enhancement, the image contrast variability due to different acquisition altitudes is compensated using
an adaptive contrast enhancement based on an image quality reference selected through a total variation
criterion. In the blending step, a graph-cut strategy operating in the image gradient domain over the
overlapping regions is suggested. Next, an out-of-core blending strategy for very large scale photo-mosaics
is presented and tested on real data. Finally, the performance of the approach is evaluated and compared with
other approaches.
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From reader reviews:

Clarence Liller:

This Image Blending Techniques and their Application in Underwater Mosaicing (SpringerBriefs in
Computer Science) are generally reliable for you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The
reason of this Image Blending Techniques and their Application in Underwater Mosaicing (SpringerBriefs in
Computer Science) can be one of several great books you must have is actually giving you more than just
simple reading through food but feed anyone with information that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge.
This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and
printed versions. Beside that this Image Blending Techniques and their Application in Underwater
Mosaicing (SpringerBriefs in Computer Science) giving you an enormous of experience such as rich
vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it
and luxuriate in reading.

Patrick Siemens:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different
to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your cost-free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want
to test look for book, may be the reserve untitled Image Blending Techniques and their Application in
Underwater Mosaicing (SpringerBriefs in Computer Science) can be excellent book to read. May be it can be
best activity to you.

Allen Green:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy your
short space of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be study. Image
Blending Techniques and their Application in Underwater Mosaicing (SpringerBriefs in Computer Science)
can be your answer because it can be read by a person who have those short extra time problems.

Cheryl Crockett:

You are able to spend your free time to read this book this reserve. This Image Blending Techniques and
their Application in Underwater Mosaicing (SpringerBriefs in Computer Science) is simple to deliver you
can read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have got much space to bring the
printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save often the
book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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