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"Should be widely read by practicing physicists, chemists and materials scientists." — Philosophical
Magazine
In this comprehensive and innovative text, Professor Harrison (Stanford University) offers a basic
understanding of the electronic structure of covalent and ionic solids, simple metals, transition metals, and
their compounds. The book illuminates the relationships of the electronic structures of these materials and
shows how to calculate dielectric, conducting, and bonding properties for each. Also described are various
methods of approximating electronic structure, providing insight and even quantitative results from the
comparisons. Dr. Harrison has also included an especially helpful "Solid State Table of the Elements" that
provides all the parameters needed to estimate almost any property of any solid, with a hand-held calculator,
using the techniques developed in the book.
Designed for graduate or advanced undergraduate students who have completed an undergraduate course in
quantum mechanics or atomic and modern physics, the text treats the relation between structure and
properties comprehensively for all solids rather than for small classes of solids. This makes it an
indispensable reference for all who make use of approximative methods for electronic-structure engineering,
semiconductor development and materials science.
The problems at the ends of the chapters are an important aspect of the book. They clearly show that the
calculations for systems and properties of genuine and current interest are actually quite elementary.
Prefaces. Problems. Tables. Appendixes. Solid State Table of the Elements. Bibliography. Author and
Subject Indexes.
"Will doubtless exert a lasting influence on the solid-state physics literature." — Physics Today
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Streeter:

This book untitled Electronic Structure and the Properties of Solids: The Physics of the Chemical Bond
(Dover Books on Physics) to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is because
when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy that book in the book
store or you can order it through online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more
easily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for your
requirements to past this e-book from your list.

Ira Knudsen:

The book untitled Electronic Structure and the Properties of Solids: The Physics of the Chemical Bond
(Dover Books on Physics) contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with
easy approach. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy
to read the item. The book was authored by famous author. The author provides you in the new period of
literary works. You can easily read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book,
you can available their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice read.

Steven Thomas:

This Electronic Structure and the Properties of Solids: The Physics of the Chemical Bond (Dover Books on
Physics) is fresh way for you who has interest to look for some information since it relief your hunger
associated with. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still
having small amount of digest in reading this Electronic Structure and the Properties of Solids: The Physics
of the Chemical Bond (Dover Books on Physics) can be the light food to suit your needs because the
information inside this book is easy to get by anyone. These books create itself in the form and that is
reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in guide form make them
feel drowsy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a e-book especially this one.
You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book
type for your better life and also knowledge.

Martha Fincher:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our understanding for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This book Electronic Structure and the Properties of Solids: The Physics of the
Chemical Bond (Dover Books on Physics) was filled in relation to science. Spend your time to add your
knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a new book. If
you know how big benefit of a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right



now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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