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A pep talk in your pocket

This short, small, highly illustrated book will fill you to the brim with happiness, positivity, wellbeing and,
most importantly, success! Andy Cope and Andy Whittaker are experts in the art of happiness and positive
psychology and The Art of Being Brilliant is crammed full of good advice, instructive case studies, inspiring
quotes, some funny stuff and important questions to make you think about your work, relationships and life.

You see being brilliant, successful and happy isn’t about dramatic change, it’s about finding out what really
works for you and doing more of it! The authors lay down their six common-sense principles that will ensure
you focus on what you’re good at and become super brilliant both at work and at home.

• A richly illustrated, 2 colour, small book full of humour, inspiring quotes and solid advice

• A great read with a serious underlying message – how to foster positivity and bring about success in every
aspect of your life

• Outlines six common-sense principles that will help you ensure you are the best you can be
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From reader reviews:

Henry Reavis:

This The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your Life by Doing What Works For You book is just not
ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is
usually information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you
read a lot of information you will get. This The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your Life by Doing What
Works For You without we recognize teach the one who examining it become critical in imagining and
analyzing. Don't end up being worry The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your Life by Doing What Works
For You can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' come to be full because
you can have it inside your lovely laptop even cell phone. This The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your
Life by Doing What Works For You having great arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Joey Mendoza:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform
Your Life by Doing What Works For You e-book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how
to make book that may be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written inside good manner for
you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still
skepticism The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your Life by Doing What Works For You as good book
not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break don't assess book by its
include, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your examining sixth
sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Jill Williams:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many query for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book but additionally novel and The Art of Being Brilliant:
Transform Your Life by Doing What Works For You or others sources were given understanding for you.
After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science reserve was created for
teacher or maybe students especially. Those ebooks are helping them to add their knowledge. In other case,
beside science book, any other book likes The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your Life by Doing What
Works For You to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Tom Tucker:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named of book
The Art of Being Brilliant: Transform Your Life by Doing What Works For You. Contain your knowledge



by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
important that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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